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|#.Tecnia Institute of

Advanced Studies Anmol Arora <tecniawebsite@tecnia.in>
Mail

Fwd: Submission of utilization certificate
1 message

Tecnia Director <director.tecniaindia@gmail.com> Fri, Jul 8, 2022 at 8:58 AM
To: eco@tecnia.in
Cc: tecniawebsite@tecnia.in, fitindiayouth@tecnia.in, studentswelfare@tecnia.in, igac@tecnia.in, deanacademics@tecnia.in

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Eco club delhi <ecoclub.delhi@delhi.gov.in>
Date: Thu, Jul 7, 2022 at 5:58 PM

Subject: Submission of utilization certificate

To: <director.tecniaindia@gmail.com>

Dear All,

It is to inform that kindly send the utilization certificate in soft copy at the earliest so that the fresh grant to the concerned school/college/institution may be

granted.
Enclosure: Utilization certificates

Regards,

Department of Environment
Level-6, Wing-C,

Delhi Secretariat

New Delhi-110002

Tel.: 011-23392032
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GFR 19-A
[See rule 212 (1)]

Form of Utilization Certificate

(ECO-Club Grant of Rs. 20000/-)

Amount | Certified that out of Rs.20, 000/- of grants-in-aid

sanctioned during the year ---- infavour of

-- School under
20000/- | this Ministry/Department Letter No. given in the

margin and RS --------------- On account of unspent
balance of the previous year, a sum of Rs.20, 000/-

has been utilized for the purpose of Eco-Club
activities for which it was sanctioned and that the
balance of RS ---------------- remaining unutilized at

the end of the year has been surrendered to

S.No. | Letter No.
and date

1. F.9/Eco/Env/
19-20/
Total

Government (vide NO_------- dated  ------ ) will

20000/- | be adjusted towards the grants-in-aid payable
during the next year_------

2. Certified that I have satisfied myself that the conditions on which the grants-in-

aid was sanctioned have been duly fulfilled/are being fulfilled and that I have

exercised the following checks to see that the money was actually utilized for the

purpose for the purpose for which it was sanctioned.

Signature of the Principal
Date
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